
Item
No. Item Description QTY

Unit of
Measur Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1

Mobilization: includes payment and performance bonds, 
insurance and cost to move equipment to project as 
required by these plans and specifications; NOT TO 
EXCEED  4% of total project cost

1 LS

30,000.00 $30,000.00 25000 $25,000.00 34000 $34,000.00

2 Traffic Control, as specified 1 LS 16,000.00 $16,000.00 10000 $10,000.00 51300 $51,300.00

3 6" Pavement and subgrade removal 7089 SY 8 $56,712.00 7 $49,623.00 6 $42,534.00

4 2" Milling and removal 15778 SY 3 $47,334.00 2 $31,556.00 2 $31,556.00

5 2" Type D Asphalt 3500 TON 105 $367,500.00 110 $385,000.00 102 $357,000.00

6 4" Type A Asphalt 1950 TON 101 $196,950.00 100 $195,000.00 100 $195,000.00

7 Black base, as needed for repair 500 TON 120 $60,000.00 150 $75,000.00 128 $64,000.00

8 Lime, 8% 150 TON 187 $28,050.00 200 $30,000.00 172 $25,800.00

9 8" Lime stabilized subgrade 7734 SY 5 $38,670.00 15 $116,010.00 8 $61,872.00

TOTAL Base Bid, Items 1 - 9 only

ADD High Density Mineral Bond, as specified 22867 SY NO BID NO BID 20 $457,340.00 NO BID NO BID

Total Bid Items 1-9, plus ADDITIVE

$917,189.00

Bid Tabulation to Sealed Bid #20012 - FY 20 Asphalt Reconstruction and Overlay Project

Project award shall be based on Unit Pricing, in an amount not to exceed the Fiscal Year budget.  Bid tab does not indicate any type of award as other 
considerations may apply.

$863,062.00

Angel Brothers Hayden Paving, Inc. Forde Constructions

$1,374,529.00 $863,062.00

$841,216.00

$841,216.00
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